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HOPE: Stories of Houston Survivors 
 opens at Holocaust Museum Houston September 22, 2023 

 
--Annual exhibition offers video introductions to local Holocaust Survivors and their families-- 

 
HOUSTON (September 20, 2023) – Learn about the extraordinary lives of seven local 
Holocaust Survivors and their legacy with the upcoming fourth installment of HOPE: Stories of 
Houston Survivors. The annual exhibition is on view September 22 through December 3, 2023, 
in Holocaust Museum Houston’s (HMH) Spira Central Gallery.   
 
Curated by Holocaust Museum Houston’s Carol Manley, HOPE: Stories of Houston Survivors 
offers a compelling video introduction of Houston Holocaust Survivors featuring family members’ 
memories, including an interview with a fourth generation Survivor. Family artifacts, including 
passports, photographs and more will be showcased throughout the exhibition. 
 
This installment of the exhibition will include local Holocaust Survivors Wolf Finkelman, Al 
Marks, Ruth Schnitzer, Otto Schlamme, Lissa Streusand, Ben Waserman and Zoly Zamir. Their 
testimonies tell stories of German occupation, the November Pogroms, life in concentration 
camps, immigration and starting anew in Houston. 
 
HOPE: Stories of Houston Survivors is supported by Lead Sponsors Texas Jewish Historical 
Society, Ronald Grabois Family Endowment Fund, Levenback Family Endowment Fund, Lynn 
and Marcel Mason Endowment Fund, Wermuth-Meicler Endowment Fund in Memory of Tola 
and Sol Rosenberg, George Wozasek Endowment Fund in memory of Miriam Gerger and Nina 
and Michael Zilkha Endowment Fund. 
 
For tickets and more information, please visit hmh.org/HOPESurvivors. 
 
Holocaust Museum Houston, Lester and Sue Smith Campus, is fully bilingual in English and 
Spanish. Located at 5401 Caroline Street, HMH is closed Mondays except Martin Luther King 
Jr. Day, Memorial Day and Labor Day from 10 a.m. to 5 p.m.; open Tuesdays through 
Saturdays, 10 a.m. to 5 p.m. and Sundays from noon to 5 p.m. The Museum’s Legacy Café is 
open during Museum hours. Admission is $22 for adults; $16 for seniors (ages 65+), AARP 
members and active duty servicemembers; always free for ages 18 and under and college 
students with valid student ID; and free to all visitors Thursdays from 2 p.m. to 5 p.m. Parking is 
available at the Museum’s adjacent lot for $8 for a four-hour period. Tickets are available 
exclusively online. For more information, visit hmh.org/visit.   
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